
INMATE SUPPLIES
RFB NO. 11-0021

Est Qty Vinyl ***Textile *Carlow *Tabb ***OD */***Herny GCI Robinson Americare ***ICS Sale ***American Just In Kimble's Charm Elliott Bob

Products Sales ****Textile Textile ****Taragin Schein, Inc  Textiles Products **** Mate ****Woolen Trend Commissary Tex Apparel, Inc. Barker

SECTION I - MCJ
1. Socks 300 doz nb nb 4.40 nb 5.36 nb 5.47 5.25 nb 9.00 nb nb nb nb 5.18 5.40 5.04

2. Jackets (Sample Required) 300 ea nb nb nb nb 25.76 nb nb 16.76 nb 31.00-51.00 nb nb nb nb 14.90-21.18 nb 15.49-21.45

3. Thermal Tops 300 nb nb 2.34/2.94 nb 26.88-49.94 nb nb 2.83 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 2.48-3.42 29.76-34.80

4. Toboggans, Orange (MCJ) (Sample Required) 60 doz nb nb 9.20 nb 11.88 nb nb 15.00 nb 11.00 nb nb nb nb 11.18 nb 9.84

5. Shower Shoes (MCJ) (Sample Required) 500 pr nb nb 2.30 nb 2.66 nb nb 1.77 nb 1.80 nb nb nb nb 1.72 nb 1.34

6. Canvas Shoes (MCJ) 500 pr nb nb 3.39 nb 3.86 nb nb 2.10 nb 3.51 nb nb nb nb 2.9 nb 2.64

7. Sheets 600 ea nb 1.75 2.93 1.95 nb nb nb 2.00 nb 37.20 nb nb nb nb 2.18 31.92 26.40

8. Blankets (Sample Required) 20 doz nb 102.60 nb 57.00 nb 235.38 nb 84.00 nb 129.60 nb nb nb nb 70.80 nb 74.40

9. Bath Towels (Sample Required) 500 doz nb 10.60 nb 12.90 nb 16.46 nb 14.00 nb 15.00 nb nb nb nb 17.72 12.92 14.70

10. Wash Cloths (Sample Required) 525 doz nb 1.92 nb 1.80 nb 2.91 4.80 12.00 nb 3.99 nb nb nb nb 2.18 1.72 1.70

11. Deodorant 50 cases nb nb nb nb nb 32.37 nb 28.00 37.45 27.90 3.87 nb nb 0.304 26.18 nb 25.44

12. Sanitary Napkins (Sample Required) 100 cases nb nb nb nb nb 36.24 nb 35.00 15.95 18.00 nb nb nb nb 43.90 nb 28.80

13.  Feminine Hygiene (Sample Required) 800 ea nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 3.50 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 1.08

14.  Toothpaste (Sample Required) 475 cases nb nb nb nb nb 106.63 nb 21 13.95 14.00 nb nb nb 0.131 16.18 nb 14.07

15.  Toothbrushes (Sample Required) 150 cases nb nb nb nb nb 97.04 nb 10.00 10.80 8.00 nb nb nb 0.04 9.18 nb 4.75

16.  Shampoo (Sample Required) 100 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 75.00 51.84 48.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 58.32

17.  Soap (Muscogee County Jail) 400 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 34.00 35.50 34.00 8.23 nb nb 0.036 29.18 nb 28.90

18.  Razor (Sample Required) 100 cases nb nb nb nb nb 70.50 nb 110.00 79.95 80.10 nb nb nb nb 77.54 nb 73.90

19.  Tumblers 5 doz nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 10.00 nb 63.35 28.50 nb nb nb nb nb 3.78

20.  Plates 10 doz nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 30.00 nb 156.45 nb nb nb nb nb nb 25.98

21.  Handcuffs 20 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 175.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 71.00

22.  Mattresses 1000 ea 155.00 nb nb nb nb nb 30.50 34.00 nb 44.95 nb nb nb nb 34.90 nb 27.44

23.  Mattress Covers 4000 ea 52.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 5.90 nb 7.18 nb nb nb nb 6.26 nb 6.58

24.  Blanket (The Cozy) 1200 ea nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 5.90 nb 4.90 nb 8.95 nb nb 5.99 nb 4.95

25.  Plastic Pocket Comb 10 cases nb nb nb nb nb 5.64 nb 5.00 36.00 35.10 nb nb nb 0.013 nb nb 35.10

26.  DentalSwab Toothsponges 5 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 20.00 nb 190.00 nb nb nb nb 89.90 nb 46.25

27.  Flex Coffee Mug 250 ea nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 6.00 nb 3.90 nb nb nb nb nb nb 4.79

28.  Sanitary Napkins 100 ea nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 0.15 19.95 18.00 28.00 nb nb nb 21.90 nb 0.105

29.  Spork 50 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 20.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 136.00

30.  Tray 750 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 20.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 12.40

31.  Mens Boxers 50 doz nb nb 11.63/16.20 nb 13.32-27.52 nb 26.4 14.25 nb 39.00-59.00 nb nb nb nb 9.90-18.90 1.18-2.30 12.48-18.66

32.  Women Cotton Panties 50 doz nb nb 7.78/9.35 nb 8.48-9.88 nb 28.19 9.00 nb 10.00-24.00 nb nb nb nb 7.18-8.90 0.80-1.08 6.00-9.00



INMATE SUPPLIES
Est Qty Vinyl ***Textile *Carlow *Tabb ***OD */***Herny GCI Robinson Americare ***ICS Sales, Inc. ***American Just In Kimble's Charm Elliott Bob
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SECTION I - MCJ - Cont
33.  Pants - Small M240/W160 nb nb nb nb 5.58 nb 7.60 4.35 nb 6.93 nb nb 9.25 nb nb nb 3.99

34.  Pants - Medium M400/W160 nb nb nb nb 5.58 nb 7.60 4.35 nb 6.93 nb nb 9.25 nb nb nb 4.14

35.  Pants - Large M1600/W320 nb nb nb nb 5.58 nb 7.60 4.35 nb 6.93 nb nb 9.50 nb nb nb 4.44

36.  Pants - Xlarge M280/W80 nb nb nb nb 5.63 nb 7.60 4.35 nb 6.93 nb nb 9.50 nb nb nb 4.44

37.  Pants - XXLarge M280/W80 nb nb nb nb 5.68 nb 7.60 4.35 nb 8.10 nb nb 9.50 nb nb nb 4.44

38.  Pants - XXXLarge M20/W20 nb nb nb nb 8.98 nb 7.60 6.75 nb 14.00 nb nb 13.50 nb nb nb 4.94

39.  Shirts - Medium 540 nb nb nb nb 5.28 nb nb 4.00 nb 6.93 nb nb 9.25 nb nb nb 3.65

40.  Shirts - Large 1,620 nb nb nb nb 5.28 nb nb 4.00 nb 6.93 nb nb 9.25 nb nb nb 4.05

41.  Shirts - Xlarge 180 nb nb nb nb 5.28 nb nb 4.00 nb 6.93 nb nb 9.75 nb nb nb 4.05

42.  Shirts - XXLarge 360 nb nb nb nb 5.34 nb nb 4.00 nb 8.10 nb nb 9.75 nb nb nb 4.05

43.  Shirts - XXXLarge 40 nb nb nb nb 7.81 nb nb 5.50 nb 14.00 nb nb 13.50 nb nb nb 5.05

44.  Shirts - Small 540 nb nb nb nb 9.74 nb nb 9.00 nb nb nb nb 9.25 nb 7.00 nb 7.05

45.  Shirts - Medium 540 nb nb nb nb 9.74 nb nb 9.00 nb nb nb nb 9.25 nb 7.00 nb 7.05

46.  Shirts - Large 1,620 nb nb nb nb 9.74 nb nb 9.00 nb nb nb nb 9.50 nb 7.18 nb 8.30

47.  Shirts - Xlarge 180 nb nb nb nb 9.74 nb nb 9.00 nb nb nb nb 9.75 nb 7.18 nb 8.30

48.  Shirts - XXLarge 360 nb nb nb nb 11.69 nb nb 11.00 nb nb nb nb 9.75 nb 8.54 nb 8.30

49.  Shirts - XXXLarge 40 nb nb nb nb 11.69 nb nb 11.00 nb nb nb nb 10.25 nb 8.54 nb 8.30

50. Shirts - XXXXLarge 40 nb nb nb nb 11.79 nb nb 11.00 nb nb nb nb 10.75 nb 8.54 nb 8.30

51.  Shirts - XXXXXLarge 40 nb nb nb nb 11.79 nb nb 11.00 nb nb nb nb 13.25 nb 8.54 nb 8.50

52.  Jeans - Small 50 nb nb nb nb 7.78 nb nb 5.50 nb nb nb nb 9.75 nb 9.18 nb 7.90

53.  Jeans - Medium 200 nb nb nb nb 7.78 nb nb 5.50 nb nb nb nb 9.75 nb 9.18 nb 7.90

54.  Jeans - Large 200 nb nb nb nb 7.78 nb nb 5.50 nb nb nb nb 10.00 nb 9.18 nb 7.90

55.  Jeans - Xlarge 200 nb nb nb nb 7.94 nb nb 5.50 nb nb nb nb 10.00 nb 9.18 nb 8.25

56.  Jeans - XXLarge 200 nb nb nb nb 7.94 nb nb 5.50 nb nb nb nb 10.00 nb 10.18 nb 8.25

57.  Jeans - XXXLarge 50 nb nb nb 10.94 nb nb 5.50 nb nb nb nb 13.50 nb 10.18 nb 8.25

SECTION II - MCP  

1.  Socks (Sample Required) 300 doz nb no bid 4.40 nb 5.36 nb 5.47 5.25 nb 9.30 nb nb nb nb 4.90 5.40 5.04

2.  Briefs 100 doz nb 8.90 9.46/12.85 nb 10.00-25.90 nb nb 9.50 nb 32.00-52.00 nb nb nb nb 10.90-13.90 0.84-1.59 11.40-13.20

3.  Undershirts (Sample Required) 300 doz nb no bid nb nb nb nb nb 37.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 34.18-42.04 26.76-40.20

4.  Work Shirts 600 nb no bid nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 8.90-11.90 nb 9.90

5.  Work Pants 240 cases nb no bid nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 7.18-11.90 nb 9.90

6.  Belts 20 cases nb no bid 1.63 nb nb nb nb 2.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 1.47

7.  Jacket (Sample Required) 300 nb no bid nb nb 25.76 nb nb 16.76 nb 31.00-51.00 nb nb nb nb 15.90-19.90 nb 15.49-21.45
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SECTION II - MCP - CONT  

8.  Thermal Tops 300 nb no bid 2.34/2.94 nb 26.88-49.94 nb nb 2.83 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 2.48-3.42 29.76-37.80

9.  Thermal Bottoms 300 nb no bid 2.34/2.94 nb 26.88-49.94 nb nb 2.83 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 2.48-3.42 28.80-33.00

10.  Toboggans, Blue (MCP) (Sample Required) 60 doz nb no bid 7.65 nb 11.88 nb nb 15.00 nb 11.00 nb nb nb nb 10.90 nb 9.84

11. Work Caps 400 nb no bid nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb

12.  Jumpsuits 400 nb no bid nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 12.85-15.85

13.  Shower Shoes (MCJ) (Sample Required) 500 nb no bid 3.39 nb 2.40 nb nb 1.77 nb 1.80 nb nb nb nb 1.72 nb 1.34

14.  Pillows 40 nb no bid nb nb nb nb nb 5.90 nb nb nb nb nb nb 4.72 nb 6.65

15.  Pillowcases 300 nb 8.10 1.06 0.72 nb nb nb 1.00 nb 14.40 nb nb nb nb 0.74 nb 0.73

16.  Sheets 600 nb 21.00 2.93 1.95 nb nb nb 2.00 nb 37.20 nb nb nb nb 2.18 31.92 2.20

17.  Blankets (Sample Required) 20 doz nb 97.20 nb 57.00 nb nb nb 84.00 nb 129.60 nb nb nb nb 70.8 nb 74.40

18.  Blankets (Sample Required) 1,200 nb 5.35 nb 4.95 nb nb nb 11.00 nb 7.50 nb 8.95 nb nb 6.72 nb 6.35

19.  Bath Towels (Sample Required) 500 doz nb 10.50 nb 12.90 nb nb nb 14.00 nb 15.00 nb nb nb nb 17.72 12.92 14.70

20.  Wash Cloths (Sample Required) 525 doz nb 1.92 nb 1.80 nb nb 4.80 2.00 nb 3.99 nb nb nb nb 2.18 1.72 1.70

21.  Toothpaste (Sample Required) 475 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 21.00 13.95 14.00 nb nb nb 0.131 16.18 nb 14.07

22.  Toothbrushes (Sample Required) 150 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 10.00 10.80 8.00 nb nb nb 0.04 9.18 nb 4.75

23.  Soap (MCP) 400 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 82.00 35.50 34.00 nb nb nb 0.036 29.18 nb 36.80

24.  Razor (Sample Required) 100 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 110.00 79.95 80.10 nb nb nb nb 77.54 nb 73.90

25.  Food Tray (MCP) 65 doz nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 30.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 18.96

26.  Tumblers 50 doz nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 6.00 nb 63.35 nb nb nb nb nb nb 3.78

27.  Laundry Bags (Sample Required) 70 doz nb 46.56 22.65 nb nb nb nb 45.00 nb 44.00 nb nb nb nb 28.90 nb 24.96

28.  Handcuffs 20 cases nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 175.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 71.00

29.  Work Boots 217 nb nb nb nb nb nb nb 25.00 nb 18.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 19.00

30.  Pants - Small 300 nb nb nb nb 5.58 nb 7.60 4.90 nb 6.93 nb nb nb nb nb nb 5.75

31.  Pants - Medium 300 nb nb nb nb 5.58 nb 7.60 4.90 nb 6.93 nb nb nb nb nb nb 6.25

32.  Pants - Large 300 nb nb nb nb 5.58 nb 7.60 4.90 nb 6.93 nb nb nb nb nb nb 6.75

33.  Pants - Xlarhe 300 nb nb nb nb 5.63 nb 7.60 4.90 nb 6.93 nb nb nb nb nb nb 6.75

34.  Pants - XXLarge 300 nb nb nb nb 5.68 nb 7.60 4.90 nb 8.10 nb nb nb nb nb nb 6.75

35.  Pants - XXXLarge 300 nb nb nb nb 8.98 nb 7.60 6.75 nb 14.00 nb nb nb nb nb nb 6.75

 

*Denote - Vendor did not acknowledge addendum #1

**Denote - Vendor did not provide required sample

***Denote - Vendor did not provide product literature

****Denote - Vendor did not provide copy of company business license


