COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Gym Equipment
RFB No. 10-0031

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during
bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting

information is discovered during analysis of the bid
January 13, 2010 responses.
TS P03 oot spcily| Q0SS | TS | Povr | Legeid | Fies | promanim | o P95 | rnss| S0
Strength Equipment, Commercial Grade

Abduction/Adduction 3,292.00 1,763.75 2,942.00 2,729.00] No Bid 2,027.22 3,234.00 1,829.00 2,450.00 1,825.00 2,535.25
Chest pres 2,928.00 1,503.75 2,935.00 2,723.00] No Bid 1,736.04 2,794.00 1,829.00 2,600.00 1,799.00 2,397.45
Incline shoulder press 3,060.00 1,570.00 2,928.00 2,716.00] No Bid 1,810.24 3,029.00 1,829.00 2,600.00 1,799.00 2,397.45
Seated row 2,827.00 1,338.75 2,762.00 2,567.00] No Bid 1,551.26 2,794.00 1,829.00 2,530.00 1,799.00 2,397.42
Hi/lat pull down 3,020.00 1,305.00 2,553.00 2,378.00] NoBid 1,513.47 2,729.00 1,829.00 2,300.00 1,799.00 2,397.45
Pec fly/rear delt 3,292.00 1,570.00 2,892.00 2,684.00f No Bid 1,810.24 2,829.00 1,829.00 2,670.00 1,825.00 2,452.45
Back extension 2,905.00 1,635.00 2,741.00 2,712.00] No Bid 1,883.03 3,093.00 1,829.00 2,600.00 1,799.00 2,342.45
Abdomnial curl 2,623.00 1,570.00 2,653.00 2,634.00f No Bid 1,810.24 3,093.00 1,829.00 2,600.00 1,799.00 2,397.45
Bicep curl 2,817.00 1,470.00 2,437.00 2,274.00] No Bid 1,698.25 2,729.00 1,829.00 2,160.00 1,799.00 2,122.45
Triceps press 2,827.00 1,536.25 2,567.00 2,391.00f No Bid 1,772.44 2,729.00 1,829.00 2,099.00 1,799.00 2,243.45
Prone leg curl 2,487.00 1,503.75 2,573.00 2,398.00f No Bid 1,736.04 2,794.00 1,829.00 2,299.00 1,799.00 2,287.45
Leg extension 2,905.00 1,570.00 2,673.00 2,634.00f No Bid 1,810.24 2,794.00 1,829.00 2,399.00 1,799.00 2,287.45
Smith machine 2,210.00 2,067.50 2,673.00 2,344.00] No Bid 2,024.21 1,975.00 1,529.00 2,999.00 1,825.00 2,308.65
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Vendors " Ctons— [Sehoot speciay| "I | TH e | systems | Finess | Resoure | POTRNME | coipn O [USA Finess | STETEEE

Cable crossover machine 3,867.00 2,232.50 2,775.00 2,954.00f No Bid 2,500.17 1,775.00 2,039.00 4,460.00 1,899.00 2,726.29
Chin/Dip assist 3,523.00 1,768.75 2,755.00 2,560.00 No Bid 2,032.82 2,559.00 1,829.00 2,599.00 1,825.00 2,232.89
Strength Equipment Total 44,583.00 24,405.00 40,859.00 38,698.00] No Bid 27,715.91 40,950.00 27,345.00 39,365.00f 27,189.00] 35,526.00

Free Weight Equipment, Commercial Grade

Chest press bench 836.00 2,270.60 1,394.00 702.00 442.50 840.76 580.00 1,029.00 1,299.00 899.00 1,562.55
Incline press bench 836.00 2,270.60 1,480.00 598.00 637.50 840.76 619.00 1,029.00 1,400.00 899.00 1,562.55
Shoulder press 836.00 2,270.60 1,480.00 422.00 562.50 840.76 619.00 1,029.00 1,599.00 899.00 1,562.55
Bicep curl 460.00 398.75 536.00 565.00 405.00 446.56 431.00 239.00 660.00 799.00 1,509.75
Adjustable ab bench 505.00 437.50 687.00 702.00 555.00 559.95 526.00 239.00 575.00 359.00 429.55
Vertical knee raise/dip 613.00 531.25 543.00 572.00 510.00 594.95 548.00 259.00 825.00 359.00 771.00
Hack squat/leg press 1,262.00 1,812.50 4,016.00 4,753.00( 2,040.00 2,029.81 1,526.00 1,579.00 2,500.00 1,399.00 2,451.63
Flat bench 230.00 198.75 338.00 409.00 247.50 222.58 229.00 155.00 350.00 130.00 259.05
Curl bar 85.00 73.75 38.00 119.00 67.46 109.19 99.00 32.00 80.00 39.00 64.80
\V/-Bar 85.00 73.75 38.00 67.00 67.46 17.47 89.00 171.00 80.00 19.00 33.00
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Vendors " Solitons - [Schoot Speciaty] "CIIES | TE U | ystoms | Fiess | Resource | POTRXIM | Equpmat e | USA Fitness| *FEC
Seated calf 460.00 398.75 795.00 799.00 480.00 446.56 431.00 279.00 900.00 329.00 823.08
Deluxe adjustable bench 493.00 427.50 774.00 780.00 510.00 478.76 441.00 259.00 750.00 359.00 520.69
Olympic flat bench 421.00 365.00 716.00 753.00 442.50 610.34 560.00 469.00 825.00 359.00 511.50
Olympic incline bench 613.00 531.25 896.00 915.00 412.50 860.92 775.00 469.00 900.00 379.00 630.85
Olympic military bench 595.00 516.25 860.00 883.00 936.00 860.92 775.00 469.00 940.00 399.00 876.37
Dumbbell set 1,287.00 1,275.00 1,492.00 1,987.75] 1,304.96 1,484.98 789.00 990.00 1,360.00 1,250.00 1,746.00
Plate tree 193.00 95.00 237.00 344.00 74.96 187.58 149.00 45.00 435.00 159.00 213.79
Hex dumbbell rack 451.00 536.25 338.00 903.00 637.50 600.54 575.00 285.00 325.00 499.00 783.50
Plate, 45 Ibs 2,316.00 45,075.00 2,320.00 2,682.00] 1,686.30 2,338.80 1,950.00 1,260.00 1,620.00 1,350.00 1,802.25
Plate, 35 Ibs. 1,562.00 26,325.00 1,579.00 1,877.20] 1,168.96 1,576.64 1,274.00 858.00 1,092.00 910.00 1,228.50
Plate, 25 Ibs. 1,115.00 18,817.50 1,161.00 1,430.00 837.46 1,126.06 910.00 593.00 780.00 650.00 867.88
Plate, 10 Ibs. 446.00 7,540.00 509.00 629.20 349.96 450.32 390.00 247.00 312.00 260.00 347.10
Plate, 5 Ibs. 223.00 1,495.00 280.00 405.60 193.96 225.16 260.00 117.00 156.00 130.00 173.68
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Innonative Fitness : Fitco Fitness Tuff Stuff Power Legend Fitness . Fitness . Specialized
Vendors Solutions School Specialty Center Fitness Systems Fitness Resource Promaxima Equipment Sales USA Fitness Fitness
Free Weight Equipment Total 15,923.00 113,735.55 22,507.00 23,297.75| 14,569.98| 17,750.37 14,545.00 12,101.00 19,763.00f 12,834.00( 20,731.62
Cardio Equipment, Commercial Grade
Treadmills 19,459.00 13,790.00 15,740.00 21,300.00 No Bid| 20,454.08 13,616.00 21,196.00 27,420.00f 19,596.00f No Bid
Elliptical 18,668.00 16,180.00 17,856.00 18,460.00 No Bid| 17,185.76 11,216.00 17,196.00 27,420.00f 16,380.00f No Bid
Recumbent Bikes 5,842.00 4,947.50 6,024.00 5,670.00 No Bid 5,704.87 5,040.00 5,798.00 7,710.00 6,390.00 No Bid
Keiser M3 Magnetic Cycle 2,261.00 1,763.98 2,240.00 1,790.00] 2,332.70 3,049.40 1,318.00 1,358.00 2,590.00 1,590.00] No Bid
Cardio Equipment Total 46,230.00 36,681.48 41,860.00 47,220.00 N/A| 46,394.11 31,190.00 45,548.00 65,140.00f 43,956.00] No Bid
TOTAL BID (ALL EQUIPMENT)|106,736.00 174,822.03 105,226.00 109,215.75 N/A 91,860.39 [86,685.00 |84,994.00 128,018.00 83,979.00 N/A
$500/vist $1,000.00 $325
Maint. Agreement Yr 1 Recommended TBD Included Call 4 Details NA | - 2,352.00 (4 quarterly [Approx. $600.00
oe . Quarterly
quarterly Visits) Comes with
3 years free
$500/vist $1,000.00 maintenance $325
Maint. Agreement Yr 2 Recommended TBD Included Call 4 Details NA | - 2,352.00 (4 quarterly [Approx. $1,200.00 Quarterl
quarterly Visits) y
Total Bid includes
$500 for logos &
3250 freight
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