DATE: 12-8-05
RFB NO. 06-0035

BID TABULATION SHEET

RFB NAME: TREE'S FOR PLANTING ON THE CITY'S RIGHT-OF-WAYS

DESCRIPTION/VENDOR Unit(s)| Crimson Dale | Moon's Tree Thoms Tree Sunsplash Nursery| Land Design
Nursery, Inc. Farm, Inc. & Plants, Inc. Exterior Designs Inc.
Name and Location of Nursery Same Location | Same Location Moon's - GA/AL Same Location LA/SC
MS/FL
Estimated cost of shipping 800.00 1150.00 7800.00 3,000.00 5,000.00
1. Acer rubrum 42 no bid 2,436.00 2,730.00 2,510.34 3,570.00
Red Maple - Summer Red
2. Prunus x yedoensis 19 no bid no bid 950.00 1,244.88 1,615.00
Yoshino Cherry
3. Acer buergerianum 'Aeryn' 2 no bid 166.00 170.00 130.00 240.00
Trident Maple
4. Betula Nigra 'Dura-Heat' 2 no bid 138.00 110.00 120.00 170.00
River Birch - Dura Heat
5. Cornus Florida 152 7,296.00 no bid 9,880.00 9,521.28 12,920.00
Flowering Dogwood - Cherokee Princess
6. Cercis Chinensis 'Avondale' 9 no bid 801.00 810.00 630.00 no bhid
Chinese Redbud - Avondale
7. Chionanthus Virginicus 10 no bid no bid 600.00 850.00 1200.00
White Fringetree, Tree Form
8. Chionanthus virginicus 17 no bid no bid 1,530.00 1390.09 2040.00
White Fringetree, multi-stem
9. Lagerstroemia Indica 14 no bid no bid 1,750.00 1,250.06 no bid
'‘Biloxi' Crape Myrtle, Tree Form (Pink)
10. Lagerstroemia Indica 93 no bid no bid 7,905.00 7,174.95 no bid
Biloxi' Crape Myrtle, Multi-Stem (Pink)
11. Lagerstroemia indica 17 no bid 1,326.00 1,105.00 1,875.10 no bid
"'Sarah's Favorite' Crape Myrtle, Tree Form (White)
12. Lagerstroemia indica 162 no bid no bid 10,530.00 12,350.88 no bid
Sarah's Favorite' Crape Myrtle, multi-stem (White)
13.Lagerstroemia indica 5 no bid 390.00 375.00 350.00 475.00
Muskogee' Crape Myrtle Tree Form (Purple)
14.Lagerstroemia indica 80 no bid no bid 6,000.00 5,400.00 no bid
“"Muskogee' Crape Myrtle, Multi-Stem (Purple)
15.Liriodendron Tulipifera 4 no bid no bid 240.00 200.00 480.00
Yellow Poplar CONTAINERIZED
16. llex x 'Nellie R. Stevens' 2 84.00 no bid 120.00 120.00 170.00
Nellie R. Stevens Holly
17. Pistacio Chinensis 38 no bid 2,964.00 3,116.00 2,669.88 no bid

Chinese Pistacio




DESCRIPTION/VENDOR Unit(s)| Crimson Dale| Moon's Tree Thoms Trees |Sunsplash Nursery| Land Design
Nursery, Inc. Farm, Inc. & Plants, Inc. Exterior Designs Inc.

18. Quercus Phellos Wllow Oak CONTAINERIZED 76 no bid no bid 3,800.00 5,140.64 6,460.00
19. Nyssa sylvatica Black Gum 3 no bid 207.00 165.00 195.00 no bid
20. Quercus Phellos 38 no bid 3,040.00 3,116.00 2,280.00 no bid
Wynstar' Willow Oak
21. Quercus Bicolor 5 no bid no bid 450.00 300.00 no bid
Swamp White Oak
22. Quercus Laurifolia 68 no bid no bid 7,820.00 5300.60 8500.00
Laurel Oak CONTAINERIZED
23. Quercus Lyrata 5 no bid 290.00 275.00 300.00 625.00
Overcup Oak
24. Quercus Prinus 5 no bid no bid 450.00 300.00 no bid
Chestnut Oak
25. Prunus serrulata 17 no bid 986.00 850.00 935.00 1445.00
Flowering Cherry
26. Ulmus Parvifolia 'Bosque’ 9 no bid 612.00 720.00 585.00 765.00
Bosque Lace Bark Elm
27. Magnolia Grandifolia 'D.D. Blanchard' 5 no bid no bid 250.00 325.00 425.00
D.D. Blanchard Magnolia
28. Quercus Virginiana, Live Oak 1 245.00 no bid 95.00 70.00 85.00
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