COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Tables & Chairs
PQ No. 11-0003

September 15, 2010

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during
bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Elements Contract

Russell Ventures, Inc.

School Outfitters

ATD-American Co.

School Specialty

Commercial Concepts &

Submission Requirements (City of Industry, CA) (Acworth, GA) (Cincinnati, OH) (Wyncote, PA (Mansfield, OH) (Inde;:rrzg:éz MO)
Addendum No. 1 v v v v v v
Addendum No. 2 v v v v v v
Addendum No. 3 v v v v v v
W-9 v v v v v v
Date of Delivery 85 days 45 days 24 days 35-45 days/ Tailgate Delivery ONLY 45 days 21-25 days
Option 1: GOPAK "Contour" Folding Table #GP00020, or equal
Product Literature v v v v v v
Warranty Information v v v v v v
Response Pages v v v v v v
Manufacturer/Make/Model AVI Elements BD004 Correll CFA3072PX Correll CFA3072M Correll RA3072 Correll CFA3072M Correll
Unit Cost $75.00 $85.11 $96.98 $108.19/$118.46 $108.44 $134.49
50 Units - Total Cost $3,750.00 $4,255.50 $4,849.00]  $5,409.50/$5,923.00 $5,422.00 $6,724.50
Option 2: VIRCO Zuma® Series, ZU415, or equal
Product Literature v v v * v v
\Warranty Information v v v v v *
Response Pages v v v v v v
Manufacturer/Make/Model AV Elements BD0O05 Columbia 1140A VIRCO Zuma® ZU415 VIRCO Zuma® ZU415 Classroom Select 206 Smith 00513
Unit Cost $38.00 $43.50 $56.87 $51.11 $20.90 54.77
100 Units - Total Cost $3,800.00 $4,350.00 $5,687.00 $5,111.00 $2,090.00 $5,477.00
Option 2: VIRCO Zuma® Series, ZU418, or equal
Product Literature v v v * v v
\Warranty Information v v v v v *
Response Pages v v v v v v
Manufacturer/Make/Model AV Elements BD005 Columbia 1150A VIRCO Zuma® ZU418 VIRCO Zuma® ZU418 Classroom Select 208 Smith 00509
Unit Cost $40.00 $46.04 $63.82 $57.98 $22.47 61.71
100 Units - Total Cost $4,000.00 $4,604.00 $6,382.00 $5,798.00 $2,247.00 $6,171.00




Submission Requirements

Elements Contract
(City of Industry, VA)

Russell Ventures, Inc.
(Acworth, GA)

School Qutfitters
(Cincinnati, OH)

ATD-American Co.
(Wyncote, PA

School Specialty
(Mansfield, OH)

Commercial Concepts &
Furniture
(Independence, MO)

Dolly for Table

Product Literature v v v * v *
Warranty Information v v v * v *
Manufacturer/Make/Model AVI Correll T3072 Correll T3072 Correll T3072 Correll T3072 Correll

Unit Cost $90.00 $136.42 $151.03 $246.94 $166.68 $179.67
Dolly for Chair
Product Literature v * v * v *
Warranty Information v v v v v *
Manufacturer/Make/Model AVI Columbia 0031 VIRCO HCT4 VIRCO HCT789 National Public Seating DY 82 NPS

Unit Cost $70.00 $359.66 $328.75 $279.86 $140.34 $143.89




Submission Requirements

Sowega Chemical

The Overby Company

VIRCO, Inc.

William Peterson & Associates

Shiffler Equipment Sales

J.M. Sales

(Albany, GA) (Columbus, GA) (Conway, AR) (Salt Lake City, UT) (Chardon, OH) (Madison, MS)
Addendum No. 1 v v v v v *
Addendum No. 2 v v v v * *
Addendum No. 3 v v v * * *
W-9 v v v v v v
Date of Delivery 14 days 46 days 10-60 days 45 days 3-5 days 21 days
Option 1: GOPAK "Contour" Folding Table #GP00020, or equal
Product Literature v No Bid No Bid v v v
Warranty Information v No Bid No Bid v v v
Response Pages v No Bid No Bid v v v
Manufacturer/Make/Model Correll RA3072 No Bid No Bid Correll RA3072 Correll CFA3072PX Correll
Unit Cost $140.00|% $119.05 $142.09 $149.45
50 Units - Total Cost $7,000.00 $0.00 $5,952.50 $7,104.50 $7,472.50
Option 2: VIRCO Zuma® Series, ZU415
Product Literature v v v v No Bid v
Warranty Information v v v v No Bid 4
Response Pages v v v v No Bid 4
Manufacturer/Make/Model VIRCO Zuma® ZU415 VIRCO Zuma® ZU415 VIRCO Zuma® ZU415 USA Capitol Millenium No Bid Early Childhood Resources
Unit Cost $70.00 $65.94 $53.84 $24.27|% $29.54
100 Units - Total Cost $7,000.00 $6,594.00 $5,384.00 $2,427.00|% $2,954.00
Option 2: VIRCO Zuma® Series, ZU418
Product Literature v v v v No Bid v
Warranty Information v v v v No Bid 4
Response Pages v v v v No Bid 4
Manufacturer/Make/Model VIRCO Zuma® ZU418 VIRCO Zuma® ZU418 VIRCO Zuma® ZU418 USA Capitol Millenium No Bid Early Childhood Resources
Unit Cost $70.00 $72.82 $60.52 $26.03|$ $29.54
100 Units - Total Cost $7,000.00 $7,282.00 $6,052.00 $2,603.00|% $2,954.00
Dolly for Table
Product Literature * No Bid No Bid v * v
Warranty Information v No Bid No Bid v v v
Manufacturer/Make/Model Correll No Bid No Bid Correll, Inc. Correll T282 Correll
Unit Cost $400.00|$ $201.40 $160.73




Submission Requirements

Sowega Chemical

The Overby Company

VIRCO, Inc.

William Peterson & Associates

Shiffler Equipment Sales

J.M. Sales

(Albany, GA) (Columbus, GA) (Conway, AR) (Salt Lake City, UT) (Chardon, OH) (Madison, MS)
Dolly for Chair
Product Literature v * v v No Bid *
Warranty Information v v v v No Bid *
Manufacturer/Make/Model VIRCO HCT4 VIRCO VIRCO HCT4 USA Capitol No Bid *
Unit Cost $550.00 $309.36 $300.54 $39.14

* Incomplete Bid
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