COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
RFB No. 12-0030 / 7-Yard Dump Trucks
Option 1: Cab and Chassis Only

June 13, 2012

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as
recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the

bid responses.

Submission Requirements

Add

Add

Add

Add

OPTION 1: Cab & Chassis Only

. Manufacturer / Make / Model Unit Price i

IKenworth of Montgomery (Montgomery, AL)1 VI*| V|V v v v 2013 Kenweorth 7270 $66.540.00 $266,—169799|
FourStar Freightliner, Inc. (Montgomery, AL) 44404 v 4 4 2013 Freightliner M2 106 $71,571.00 $286,284.00|
TransPower, Inc. (Albany, GA) VvV v v v 2013 Kenworth T370 $72,071.00 $288,284.00|
Yancey Truck Centers (Columbus, GA) v iviviv v v v 2013 International 4400 $74,404.97 $297,619.88|
Beck Motor Co./Tri-State Peterbilt (Albany, GA) v viIviv 4 4 4 2013 Peterbilt 348 $75,542.00 $302,168.00|
Peterbilt of Atlanta, LLC (Jackson, GA) VI vVIv]* v v v 2012 Peterbilt 337 $78,300.00 $313,200.00|
Peach State Ford/ATL FL (Norcross, GA) VI vIvIv v v v 2013 Freightliner M2 106 NO BID

Park Built Body Co., Inc. (Sylvester, AL) v viIviv 4 v v NO BID

Interstate Truck Equipment, Inc. (College Park, GA) v vI v|v v v v NO BID

Transport Equipment Co., Inc. (Albany, GA) VARAR A v v v NO BID

Truck Equipment Sales (Cantonment, FL) VARAR A v v v NO BID

ICommercial Truck & Van Equipment (Norcross, GA) VI vI vi|v v v v NO BID

"NO BID" RESPONSES:

Allan Vigil Ford Lincoln, Inc.

Texas Motors Ford

Speedway Ford

Municipal Equipment

Peterbilt Truck Centers

\Wade Ford

* Incomplete Bid

! Withdrawn
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COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

RFB No. 12-0030 / 7-Yard Dump Trucks
Option 2: Body Only

June 13, 2012

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as
recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the
bid responses.

Submission Requirements

Add

Add

Add

Add

OPTION 2: Body Only

et e Rffginfe Manufacturer / Make / Model Unit Price Total Price

Park Built Body Co., Inc. (Sylvester, AL) 44404 v 4 4 2012 Crysteel Select $12,014.75 $48,059.00]
ICommercial Truck & Van Equipment (Norcross, GA) v vI v|v v v v 2012 Godwin 300T $12,775.00 $51,100.004
Truck Equipment Sales (Cantonment, FL) VARAR A v v v 2012 Warren F10 451 $12,844.00 $51,376.00)
Transport Equipment Co., Inc. (Albany, GA) vV vI|vI|v v v v 2012 Godwin 300T $13,395.00 $53,580.00]
[Peterbilt of Atlanta, LLC (Jackson, GA) VI vI|v]* v v v 2012 Warren F10 $14,175.00 $56,700.00}
Interstate Truck Equipment, Inc. (College Park, GA) v vI v|v v v v 2012 Warren F10 $14,175.00 $56,700.004
Yancey Truck Centers (Columbus, GA) vivi iviv NO BID

IKenworth of Montgomery (Montgomery, AL) *|v]v NO BID

TransPower, Inc. (Albany, GA) v iviviv NO BID

Peach State Ford/ATL FL (Norcross, GA) vivivivl v v v 2012 Ox Bodies Maverick NO BID

Beck Motor Co./Tri-State Peterbilt (Albany, GA) 24 4404 NO BID

FourStar Freightliner, Inc. (Montgomery, AL) 44404 NO BID

* Incomplete Bid



COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT

RFB No. 12-0030 / 7-Yard Dump Trucks

Option 3: Complete Unit

June 13, 2012

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as
recorded during bid opening; they may include
incorrect price extensions or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the

bid responses.

Submission Requirements

Add

Add

Add

Add

OPTION 3: Complete Unit

odiet e e Manufacturer / Make / Model Unit Price To;rfllmlisr)ice
Peach State Ford/ATL FL (Norcross, GA) VIivivivi v | v | v | vV zoirfg:tggﬁirg a;(,)gfck $85,700.00 $342,800.001
[Peterbilt of Atlanta, LLC (Jackson, GA) ViviVI*{ v | vV IV |V |V |V zﬁe\ﬂ:ﬁﬁo $92,475.00 $369,900.00]
Interstate Truck Equipment, Inc. (College Park, GA) vV vI|vI|v NO BID
Yancey Truck Centers (Columbus, GA) vV vI|vI|v NO BID
Transport Equipment Co., Inc. (Albany, GA) vV vI|vI|v NO BID
IKenworth of Montgomery (Montgomery, AL) *|v]v NO BID
Truck Equipment Sales (Cantonment, FL) vV vI|vI|v NO BID
TransPower, Inc. (Albany, GA) v iviviv NO BID
ICommercial Truck & Van Equipment (Norcross, GA) vV vI|vI|v NO BID
Beck Motor Co./Tri-State Peterbilt (Albany, GA) v viIviv NO BID
FourStar Freightliner, Inc. (Montgomery, AL) v viIviv NO BID
Park Built Body Co., Inc. (Sylvester, AL) VI vIviv NO BID

* Incomplete Bid
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