
COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Office Furniture
RFB No. 12-0012

September 14, 2011

Submission Requirements Georgia Correctional Industries
(Decatur, GA)

School Specialty
(Mansfield, OH)

Ernie Morris
Enterprises, Inc.
(Bushnell, FL)

The Overby Company
(Columbus, GA)

Malone Office Environments
(Columbus, GA)

Advanced Office Products
(Columbus, GA)

Quill
(Lincolnshire, IL)

Addendum No. 1
Addendum No. 2
Addendum No. 3
Addendum No. 4
Addendum No. 5
Addendum No. 6 *
Option 1 -- Professional VeraFlex Fabric Chair
Product Literature * *
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model GCI #240JRAA Basis of design Office Star 13-V44N1WA Office Star Products
#13-V44N1WA Office Star #13V44N1WA Office Star

OSP13V44N1WA Office Star #13V44N1WA

Unit Cost $210.00 $154.42 $248.05 $245.57 $235.63 $254.00 $181.00
19 Units - Total Cost $3,990.00 $2,933.98 $4,712.95 $4,665.83 $4,476.97 $4,826.00 $3,439.00

Option 2 -- Right Pedestal Desks and Left Pedestal Returns
Product Literature

NO BID

* *
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model Basis of design HON P3265RNS / 
HON P3236LNS

HON P3265RNS / 
HON P3236LNS

HON P3265RNS /
HON P3236LNS

HON P3265RNS / 
HON P3236LNS

HON P3265RNS /
HON P3236LNS

Unit Cost $644.37 663.78 $678.82 $692.64 $690.00 $725.00
9 each (18 Units Total) - Total Cost $5,799.33 $5,974.02 $6,109.38 $6,233.76 $6,210.00 $6,525.00

Option 3 -- Left Pedestal Desks and Right Pedestal Returns
Product Literature

NO BID

* *
Warranty Information
Response Pages

Manufacturer/Make/Model Basis of design HON P3266LNS /
HON P3235RNS

HON P3266LNS /
HON P3235RNS

HON P3266LNS /
HON P3235RNS

HON P3266LNS /
HON P3235RNS

HON P3266LNS /
HON P3235RNS

Unit Cost $644.37 $663.78 $678.82 $692.64 $690.00 $725.00
8 each (16 Units Total) - Total Cost $5,154.96 $5,310.24 $5,430.56 $5,541.12 $5,520.00 $5,800.00

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during
bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid
responses.



COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Office Furniture
RFB No. 12-0012

September 14, 2011

Submission Requirements Georgia Correctional Industries
(Decatur, GA)

School Specialty
(Mansfield, OH)

Ernie Morris
Enterprises, Inc.
(Bushnell, FL)

The Overby Company
(Columbus, GA)

Malone Office Environments
(Columbus, GA)

Advanced Office Products
(Columbus, GA)

Quill
(Lincolnshire, IL)

Option 4 -- Slide-a-way Laminate Keyboard Platform
Product Literature

NO BID

* *
Warranty Information
Response Pages
Manufacturer/Make/Model Basis of design HON H4022N HON 4022N HON4022N HON H4022N HON H4022N

Unit Cost $70.20 $72.68 $78.52 $82.56 $72.40 $79.00
17 Units - Total Cost $1,193.40 $1,235.56 $1,334.84 $1,403.52 $1,230.80 $1,343.00

Option 5 -- Low Pile Economy Chair Mat
Product Literature

NO BID

Warranty Information
Response Pages
Manufacturer/Make/Model Deflect-O Economat LLR 69163 LORELL LLR69163 LORELL LLR 69163 DEFLECTO LLR69163 QUILL

Unit Cost $61.14 $44.00 $43.56 $45.52 $42.20 $39.00
17 Units - Total Cost $1,039.38 $748.00 $740.52 $773.84 $717.40 $663.00

Assembly/Set-Up INCLUDED $1,784.21 $0.00 $0.00 - - $1,000.00

GRAND TOTAL $3,990.00 $17,905.26 $17,980.77 $18,281.13 $18,429.21 $18,504.20 $18,770.00

  * Incomplete Bid ** Vendor Quotes "All or None" for Options 2-4

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded
during bid opening; they may include incorrect price
extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to
change if conflicting information is discovered during
analysis of the bid responses.



COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Office Furniture
RFB No. 12-0012

September 14, 2011

Submission Requirements
Minton Jones

Contract Furniture
(Marietta, GA)

Sliauter Associates
(Doraville, GA)

Business Interiors
by Staples

(Atlanta, GA)

ATD-American Co**
(Wyncote, PA)

Peachtree Supplies
(Atlanta, GA)

Aaron's Government and 
Collegiate Sales

(Duluth, GA)

Diversified
Resource Group
(Norcross, GA)

Addendum No. 1
Addendum No. 2
Addendum No. 3
Addendum No. 4
Addendum No. 5 *
Addendum No. 6 *
Option 1 -- Professional VeraFlex Fabric Chair
Product Literature
Warranty Information
Response Pages *
Manufacturer/Make/Model Eurotech MT9400 BOSS B580 Office Star Products

#13-V44N1WA AS SPECIFIED HON basyx Space Seating 13-V44N1W Chromecraft Y546-23877

Unit Cost $190.00 $170.00 $210.30 $215.97 $239.99 $180.65 $236.00
19 Units - Total Cost $3,610.00 $3,230.00 $3,995.70 $4,103.43 $4,559.81 $3,432.35 $4,484.00

Option 2 -- Right Pedestal Desks and Left Pedestal Returns
Product Literature *
Warranty Information
Response Pages *
Manufacturer/Make/Model Marvel PDR6630SPDTMA /

Marvel PRR4824SPDTMA
HON P3265RNS /
HON P3236LNS

HON HP3265R / 
HON HP3236L AS SPECIFIED HON P3236LNS /

HON P3266LNS
HON P3265RNS /
HON P3236LNS

Marvel Pronto PDR6630SP /
Marvel Pronto PRR4824SPF special

Unit Cost $808.00 $824.25 730.66 $705.76 $819.98 $829.33 $999.83
9 each (18 Units Total) - Total Cost $7,272.00 $7,418.25 $6,575.94 $6,351.84 $7,379.82 $7,463.97 $8,998.47

Option 3 -- Left Pedestal Desks and Right Pedestal Returns
Product Literature *
Warranty Information
Response Pages *
Manufacturer/Make/Model Marvel PDR6630SPDTMA /

Marvel PRR4824SPDTMA
HON P3266LNS /
HON P3235RNS

HON HP3266L / 
HON HP3235R AS SPECIFIED HON P3235RNS /

HON P3265RNS
HON P3266LNS /
HON P3235RNS

Marvel Pronto PDR6630SP /
Marvel Pronto PRR4824SPF special

Unit Cost $808.00 $824.25 $730.66 $705.76 $819.98 $829.33 $999.83
8 each (16 Units Total) - Total Cost $6,464.00 $6,594.00 $5,845.28 $5,646.08 $6,559.84 $6,634.64 $7,998.64

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid
opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid responses.



COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Office Furniture
RFB No. 12-0012

September 14, 2011

Submission Requirements
Minton Jones

Contract Furniture
(Marietta, GA)

Sliauter Associates
(Doraville, GA)

Business Interiors
by Staples

(Atlanta, GA)

ATD-American Co**
(Wyncote, PA)

Peachtree Supplies
(Atlanta, GA)

Aaron's Government and 
Collegiate Sales

(Duluth, GA)

Diversified
Resource Group
(Norcross, GA)

Option 4 -- Slide-a-way Laminate Keyboard Platform
Product Literature * * *
Warranty Information
Response Pages *
Manufacturer/Make/Model Ergonomic Concepts ECI-903 HON H4022N HON H4022N HON H840000 HON4022N HON H4022 HON4022N

Unit Cost $63.00 $90.24 $80.82 $175.43 $83.99 $91.73 $110.79
17 Units - Total Cost $1,071.00 $1,534.08 $1,373.94 $2,982.31 $1,427.83 $1,559.41 $1,883.43

Option 5 -- Low Pile Economy Chair Mat
Product Literature *
Warranty Information * *
Response Pages *
Manufacturer/Make/Model LORELL LLR69163 ES ROBBINS 128153 ES ROBBINS 20230-CC AS SPECIFIED UNV56808 ES ROBBINS 128353 LORELL 69163

Unit Cost $52.00 $40.18 $42.53 $85.13 $52.99 $47.00 $69.75
17 Units - Total Cost $884.00 $683.06 $723.01 $1,447.21 $900.83 $799.00 $1,185.75

Assembly/Set-Up $0.00 - $1,533.33 INCLUDED $299.99 $2,066.67 $500.00

GRAND TOTAL $19,301.00 $19,459.39 $20,047.20 $20,530.87 $21,128.12 $21,956.04 $25,050.29

  * Incomplete Bid ** Vendor Quotes "All or None" for Options 2-4

"NO BID" RESPONSES:
Virco Mfg.
Walter Hopkins Company
Pro-Line 
Total Office Solutions
My Supplies 

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during
bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or
transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting
information is discovered during analysis of the bid
responses.
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