

**COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
METRA Vehicles
RFB No. 11-0010**

October 6, 2010

This is a draft tabulation. The entries are as recorded during bid opening; they may include incorrect price extensions or transcription errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is discovered during

Submission Requirements	Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA)	Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA)	Carl Black Buick Pontiac GMC (Kennesaw, GA)	Lou Sobh GMC/Buick (Duluth, GA)	Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA)	Knapheide (City, State)	Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	Park-Built Body Company, Inc. (Sylvester, GA)
Addendum No. 1	✓	✓	✓	✓	*	✓	✓	✓
Addendum No. 2	✓	✓	✓	✓	*	✓	✓	✓
Addendum No. 3	✓	✓	✓	✓	*	✓	✓	✓
Contract Pages	✓	✓	✓	*	✓	✓	✓	✓
W-9	✓	✓	✓	*	✓	✓	✓	✓
Option 1 -- Fifteen (15) Passenger Van								
Product Literature	✓	✓	✓	✓	*	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Warranty Information	✓	✓	*	*	*	No Bid	*(2010)	No Bid
Response Pages	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Manufacturer/Make/Model	2011 Ford E-350	2011 Ford Club Wagon XL	2011 Chevrolet CG33706	2011 GMC/Savana/ILS	2011 Ford E-350 XL	No Bid	2011 Ford E-350	No Bid
Unit Price	\$22,260.00	\$22,028.86	\$27,655.00	\$29,190.00	\$23,140.00	No Bid	\$22,594.00	No Bid
Next Year's Price	TBD	\$22,528.86	\$27,655.00	Not Provided	\$23,140.00	No Bid	N/A	No Bid
Option 2A -- Service Truck -- 4x2 (3/4 ton) Pickup Truck -- Cab & Chassis Only								
Product Literature	✓	No Bid	✓	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Warranty Information	✓	No Bid	✓	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	*(2010)	No Bid
Response Pages	✓	No Bid	✓	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Manufacturer/Make/Model	2011 Ford F-250	No Bid	2011 Chevrolet CC20903	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2011 Ford F-250	No Bid
Unit Cost	\$17,323.00	No Bid	\$19,422.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18,098.00	No Bid
Next Year's Price	TBD	No Bid	\$19,422.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	No Bid

Submission Requirements	Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA)	Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA)	Carl Black Buick Pontiac GMC (Kennesaw, GA)	Lou Sobh GMC/Buick (Duluth, GA)	Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA)	Knapheide (City, State)	Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	Park-Built Body Company, Inc. (Sylveste, GA)
Option 2B -- Service Truck -- 4x2 (3/4 ton) Pickup Truck -- Body Only								
Product Literature	No Bid	No Bid	*	No Bid	No Bid	✓	✓	✓
Warranty Information	No Bid	No Bid	*	No Bid	No Bid	✓	*	✓
Response Pages	No Bid	No Bid	✓	No Bid	No Bid	*	✓	*
Manufacturer/Make/Model	No Bid	No Bid	Monroe MCB SB 96M 4816	No Bid	No Bid	Knapheide Midsouth 696J	Knapheide 696J	Knapheide 696J
Unit Cost	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,312.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,890.00	\$3,840.00	\$4,525.00
Next Year's Price	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,312.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,890.00	N/A	(+/-) \$5,500.00
Option 2C -- Service Truck -- 4x2 (3/4 ton) Pickup Truck -- Complete Unit								
Product Literature (cab & chassis)	✓	✓	✓	✓	*	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Product Literature (body)	✓	✓	*	✓	*	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Warranty Information (cab & chassis)	✓	✓	✓	*	*	No Bid	(2010)	No Bid
Warranty Information (body)	✓	✓	*	*	*	No Bid	*	No Bid
Response Pages (cab & chassis)	✓	✓	✓	*	*	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Response Pages (body)	✓	*	✓	*	*	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Manufacturer/Make/Model (cab & chassis)	2011 Ford F-250	2011 Ford F250 XL	2011 Chevrolet CC20903	2010 GMC/Sierra/ W/T	2011 Ford F-250 XL	No Bid	2011 Ford F-250	No Bid
Manufacturer/Make/Model (body)	Knapheide 696J	Knapheide 696J	Monroe MCB SB 96M 4816	Knapheide 696J1	*	No Bid	Knapheide 696J	No Bid
Unit Cost	\$21,293.00	\$21,521.00	\$23,734.00	\$26,547.00	\$22,170.00	No Bid	\$21,938.00	No Bid
Next Year's Price	TBD	\$21,921.00	\$23,734.00	Not Provided	\$22,170.00	No Bid	N/A	No Bid
Option 3 -- Mid-Size Sedan								
Product Literature	✓	✓	✓	✓	*	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Warranty Information	*	✓	*	*	*	No Bid	(2010)	No Bid
Response Pages	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	No Bid	✓	No Bid
Manufacturer/Make/Model	2011 Ford Fusion	2011 Ford Fusion SE	2011 Chevrolet Impala	2010 Buick/ LaCrosse/CX	2011 Ford Fusion SE	No Bid	2011 Ford Fusion	No Bid
Unit Cost	\$16,898.00	\$17,355.43	\$18,825.00	\$25,093.00	\$17,602.73	No Bid	\$17,090.00	No Bid

Submission Requirements	Wade Ford (Smyrna, GA)	Rivertown Ford (Columbus, GA)	Carl Black Buick Pontiac GMC (Kennesaw, GA)	Lou Sobh GMC/Buick (Duluth, GA)	Legacy Ford (McDonough, GA)	Knapheide (City, State)	Allan Vigil Ford (Morrow, GA)	Park-Built Body Company, Inc. (Sylvester, GA)
Next Year's Price	TBD	\$17,533.00	\$18,825.00	Not Provided	\$17,602.73	No Bid	N/A	No Bid