COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
One Ton Dual Rear Wheel Crew Cab
with 8 1/2 Foot Flat Dump Bed Body

RFB No0.10-0033
January 6, 2010

This is a draft tabulation. Entries are as recorded during bid
opening, may include incorrect price extensions, or transcription
errors, and are subject to change if conflicting information is

discovered during analysis of the bid responses.

Submission Requirements

Transport Equipment Co.

Allan Vigil Ford

Trans Power, Inc.

Lou Sobh Pontiac
Buick GMC, Inc.

Legacy Ford, Inc.

Wade Ford

(Albany, GA) (Morrow, GA) (Albany, GA) (Duluth, GA) (McDonough, GA) (Smyrna, GA)
Product Literature: Cab & Chassis No Bid 4 v v v v
Body v v No Bid v * No Bid
Warranty Information: Cab & Chassis No Bid v v * v v
Body v * No Bid * * No Bid
Response Pages v v v v v v
Customer History Sheet (body only) v v No Bid * v No Bid
W-9 v v v * v v
Cab and Chassis Year/Make/Model No Bid 2011 Ford F350 2011 Ford F350 2010 GMC 3500 2011 Ford F350 2011 Ford F350

2010 K&K Mfg

Body Year/Make/Model 2oo$;rnasn2p:;ré g%“ip ; 02D No Bid Custom CTVE 86" | 2010 Knapheide KTEC8'6" No Bid
OPTION 1: Cab and Chassis Only (Unit Price) $0.00 $23,593.00 $25,026.00 $24,604.13 $23,779.00 $22,897.00

(4 Units) TOTAL $0.00 $94,372.00 $100,104.00 $98,416.52 $95,116.00 $91,588.00
OPTION 2: Body Only (Unit Price) $6,700.00 $6,175.00 $0.00 $6,566.50 $5,790.00 $0.00

(4 Units) TOTAL $26,800.00 $24,700.00 $0.00 $26,266.00 $23,160.00 $0.00
OPTION 3: Complete Unit (Unit Price) $0.00 $29,768.00 $0.00 $31,191.63 $29,554.00 $0.00

(4 Units) TOTAL $0.00 $119,072.00 $0.00 $124,766.52 $118,216.00 $0.00

*Incomplete Bid
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Submission Requirements

Park-Built Body Co., Inc.
(Sylvester, GA)

Bartow Ford Company
(Bartow, FL)

Brooker Ford
Lincoln Mercury

Duval Ford
Government Sales

Terry Cullen Chevrolet
(Jonesboro, GA)

Dawson Motor Co.
(Dawson, GA)

(Dalton, GA) (Jacksonville, FL)
Product Literature: Cab & Chassis No Bid 4 v v v v
Body v v * v v No Bid
Warranty Information: Cab & Chassis No Bid * 4 v v v
Body v * * v v No Bid
Response Pages v v v v v v
Customer History Sheet (body only) v v * v v No Bid
W-9 v v v v v v
Cab and Chassis Year/Make/Model No Bid 2011 Ford F350 2011 Ford F350 2011 Ford F350 2010 Chevrolet 2011 Ford F350

Silverado 3500

2010 Freedom

2010 Interstate Truck

Body Year/Make/Model 2010 PB 8.6 FD CTMS-524-SP 2010 Knapheide KTECS8'6"| 2009 Knapheide PVYMXS 9 8596 FBD SPCL No Bid
OPTION 1: Cab and Chassis Only (Unit Price) $0.00 $26,482.00 $23,260.00 $24,141.00 $24,800.00 $23,818.00

(4 Units) TOTAL $0.00 $105,928.00 $93,040.00 $96,564.00 $99,200.00 $95,272.00
OPTION 2: Body Only (Unit Price) $5,354.80 $6,400.00 $5,972.65 $7,791.00 $6,978.00 $0.00

(4 Untis) TOTAL $21,419.20 $25,600.00 $23,890.60 $31,164.00 $27,912.00 $0.00
OPTION 3: Complete Unit (Unit Price) $0.00 $29,168.00 $29,120.00 $31,091.00 $31,778.00 $0.00

(4 Units) TOTAL $0.00 $116,672.00 $116,480.00 $124,364.00 $127,112.00 $0.00

*Incomplete Bid
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