COLUMBUS CONSOLIDATED GOVERNMENT
Commercial Kitchen Equipment
PQ No. 11-0006

October 6, 2010

Refrigerator,
Under-Counter
(Beverage Air UCR48A or equal)

Freezer,

Bottom-Mounted
(Beverage Air KF48-1AS or

Oven,
Commercial Hi-Speed
(Sharp R-8000G or equal)

Humidity Cabinet,
Hot Food
(Star HFD3ACR or equal)

Ice Machine,
1000lbs Cube

(Scotsman C1030SA-32B or

Ice Storage Bin,

Modular

(Scotsman HTB555 or equal)

equal) equal)
Vendors
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Gulf Ice Systems . . . . Ice O Matic Cornelius
ensacola
P 2 FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Y| Y|Y 1006HA 3,310.00 Y |Y|Y B530AP 671.00
Scotsman
Standard Restaurant Supply Sharp Star Scotsman
(Boise D) Y| Y|Y|] True TUC48 [1,893.72 JY|Y|Y| True T4A9F |3,601.38QY|Y[Y|Y R800G 1,497.75 JY|Y|Y HED3ACR 1,901.36 Y| Y|Y ClOSSZOBSA- 3,39487 JY|Y|Y B530P 727.26
. . Scotsman
Sam Tell & Son BevAir BevAir KF48- Sharp STAR Scotsman
(Farmingdale NY) N[ N]Y UCR48A 1,787.56 IN|N|Y 1AS 3,482.78Y|[Y|Y]|Y R800G 1,744.00 IN|N|Y HED3ACR 1,967.70 NI N|Y ClOSSZOBSA- 3,93856 Y |Y|Y B530P 775.85
Strategic Equip. & Supply BevAir BevAir KF48- Sharp STAR SETEIET Scotsman
(Albany GA) NIY]Y UCR48A 1,885.00 IN|Y|Y 1AS 3,621.00 Y[N|Y|Y R800G 1,731.00 IN|Y|Y HED3ACR 2,025.00 IN| Y |Y ClOSSZOBSA- 4,000.00 IN|Y|Y B530P 915.00
. . . Scotsman
Direct South BevAir BevAir KF48- Sharp STAR Scotsman
(Buford GA) Y[Y]Y UCR48A 1,682.00 JY|Y|Y 1AS 3,275.00Y|[Y|Y]Y R800G 1,650.00 JY|Y|Y HED3ACR 1,950.00 Y| Y|Y ClOSSZOBSA- 3,900.00 Y |Y|Y B530P 765.00
. Scotsman
Cooks Direct . . Panasonic STAR Scotsman
(Warrenville IL) No Bid No Bid NIY]Y]Y NE3280 3,490.00 jY|Y|Y HED3ACR 1,949.00 Y| Y|Y ClOSSZOBSA- 3,598.00 Y |Y|Y B530P 749.00
Manning Bros. Food Equip. v{v|v] BEVAT 1181234 [v|v|v|BEVATKFAE 13 ags o3 v |v| v (Y| S 161000 fv|v|v| STAR l1,00430 |¥|v|v cslcgct’)%n;i\n- 3,760.66 | Y | v| Y| SCOSMAN |766 o1
(Athens GA) UCR48A ' ' 1AS ' ' R800G (™ ' HFD3ACR |’ ' 328 ' ' B530P '
Sl oLl IS NI N[y BEYAIT 15 a08.00 In| || BEVATKFA8- 1 oaa 00 v || n|v] SPa (1897.00 In|n|v|, STAR |2866.00 In|n|Y cslcgzts%n;i\n- 4,348.00 | ] v| SCOSMaN 1500 00
(Detroit MI) UCR48A ' ' 1AS ' ' R800G (™ ' HFD3ACR |’ ' 328 ' ' HTB555 '
Kamran and Co BevAir BevAir KF48- Sharp STAR Scotsman Scotsman
(Santa Barbara CA) Y[Y]Y UCR48A 1,79545 Y| Y|Y 1AS 324765 Y|Y|Y]|Y R800G 1,875.00 JY|Y|Y HED3ACR 1,956.34 Y| Y|Y ClOSSZOBSA- 3,395.96 g Y |Y|Y B530P 778.92
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. . . Cornelius .
RJH Air Cond. & Refrigeration US Refrigerator US Refrigerator Sharp STAR Cornelius
(Beltsville MD) YIYI|Y UUC.48 1,554.78 Y|Y|Y UM-48F 3,001.62Y|Y|Y]|Y R800G 2,068.63 JY|Y]|Y HED3ACR 2,280.18 fY|Y]|Y CCM 3,62892 Y |Y|Y BB24P 1,024.10
1030Ah2
. Scotsman
HM Store Fixture Co. Amana STAR Scotsman
(Norcross GA) Y| Y|Y| True TUC48 [1,692.54 §Y|Y|Y| True T49F [3,302.24QY|Y|Y|Y Ace 14 2,955.49 fY|Y|Y HED3ACR 1,949.97 Y| Y|Y ClOSSZOBSA- 3,903.08 Y |Y|Y B530P 768.86
Thompson & Little BevAir BevAir KF48- Sharp STAR Scotsman Scotsman
(Fayetteville NC) YIYI|Y UCRA8A 1,683.05 JY|Y]|Y 1AS 3,305.84Y|Y|Y]|Y R800G 1,496.77 QY|Y|Y HED3ACR 1,878.70 JY| Y|Y ClOSSZOBSA- 3,60425 QY |Y|Y B530P 748.96
Atlanta Fixtures & Sales BevAir BevAir KF48- Amana STAR Manitowoc Manitowoc
(Atlanta GA) N|lYLY UCR48A 1542.18 IN|Y|Y 1AS 3,00469 IN[N|Y|Y ALD10D 224.30 NIY]Y HED3ACR 1,644.45 IN|IN|Y SY 1004A 3,686.48 N [N|Y B-570 752.31

*Shaded areas are indicative of quotes not containing the required Product Literature, Warranty Information, Response to Detail Specifications and/or
Acknowledgement of Receipt for Addendum No. 1. Said quotes are deemed incomplete and ineligible for award consideration.




